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Transformation Directorate
Service Director: Emma Marshall
Wakefield One 
Burton St 
Wakefield 
WF1 3EB
Typetalk calls welcome
Contact: Senior Information Governance Officer
T 01924 306112
E: freedomofinformation@wakefield.gov.uk 
Typetalk calls welcome
From a textphone dial: 18001 0345 8 503 503
From a telephone dial: 18002 0345 8 503 503


Dear Requester,

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000- REQUEST FOR INFORMATION  
REF: FOI 555

I am writing in respect of your recent enquiry for information held by the Authority under the provisions of the Freedom of Information Act. 

Please find the response to your request below. 

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I would like to request the following information:

1. The number of employees currently working under a compressed hours arrangement, where contracted weekly hours are worked over fewer than the standard number of working days. E.g over a four day week or nine day fortnight.

Unfortunately, we do not categorise or identify “compressed hours” as a distinct working pattern. As such, we are unable to accurately extract or confirm the number of employees working in this way. We can only distinguish between full-time and non-full-time working patterns, and do not hold more granular data to identify specific arrangements such as compressed hours. 

2. The total number of employees within the authority, to allow the above figure to be expressed as a proportion of the workforce.

The total, number of employees currently is 5,053




3.  Any internal reports, policies, or management information relating to the use of compressed hours.

We do not hold a specific policy relating to compressed hours. However, employees have the right to request flexible working arrangements, which may include working their contracted hours over a reduced number of days.


I trust that this information is satisfactory for your purposes, but please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any further queries regarding this matter.

If you are not satisfied with the way the Authority has handled your requests, you may ask for an internal review. To request a review please contact the Corporate Information Governance Team in writing to the below address or email freedomofinformation@wakefield.gov.uk and an internal review of your case will be arranged. 
 
Corporate Information Governance Team, 
Wakefield One, Wakefield,  
West Yorkshire  
WF1 2EB 



Yours faithfully, 

Information Governance Officer
Corporate Information Governance Team 
Legal and Governance
Wakefield Council
Tel: 01924 306112
E-mail: freedomofinformation@wakefield.gov.uk
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